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| Set For Monday 

Temporary I. D. Cards 
Any student who does not have an I. 

D. card or is using a temporary I. D. 
ecard with any signature other than 
Jim Speights is advised to consult 

SGA President 

itterneen 
the before Friday 
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Coriolano, Avery 
i Roles In ‘Philadelphia Story’ 

WORLDLY TWO pictured above are Alice Coriolano and Ben Avery, 
the stars in Philadelphia Story, the ECC Playhouse’s first major 

tion of the year. Opening night 
s 1. be picked up next week in the cafeteria. 
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is scheduled for October 27, Reserved   

men and 

"| Dr. Horne also noted the change in 

Hitem, ‘A’ is ercellent, 93-100; ‘B’ is 

Final Enrollment Indicates Increase 
Of 554 Over Last 
Official enro:!iment figures releus- 

ed this week by Dr. John H. Horne, 
registrar, indicate a total increase of 

“54 students over last year. 

official tabula- 
4,599 students are enrolled for 

This total in- 
cludes 4,141 full time students with 
the remainder in graduate, special or 

According to an 
| ti | ion, | 

fall quarter courses. 

extension work. Fall quarter enroll- 

ment last year totaled 4,045, 

A large part of the enrullment in- 

crease may be attributed to the large 
freshman class. Of the total enroll- 
ment figure, 1,750 students are fresh- 

255 are transfers, 
In announcing the enrollment total, 

the grading system which went into 
etfect this year. Under the new sys- 

good, 85-92; ‘C’ is average, 78-84; 
‘D’ is barely passing 70-77 and ‘F" is 
failing, course must be repeated to 
secure credit. 

Another change, which will take 
effect next fall, is in the entrance 

    

University President Opposes Decision 
Concerning Communistic Speakers 

escinding of a ten 

speakers at 

Detroit 
last 

Michiganites in- 

ytesting the ban’s 

, drafted by a- 

has received little 

rsity, 

opposition 

as lifted by the Board 
recommenda- 

The move was 

by University 
nee Hillberry who 

policies which 

a university 

| 

tablish the 

3yerlein and 

ser, two adults not 
Wayne ' 

taste poison | 

Commu- 
treated like bubonic 

eontact you 

essary to 

kill you 

the nore 

ir immunity 

ed Miss Byerlein, 

students at Wayne, 

a care what the stu- 

ve,” added Lobsinger, 

ters of the state and 

responsible to us.” 

ate supported institu- 

test group has been] 

s, according to Ber- 

of the Wayne State 

From earlier appear- 

ences of student senti- 

expect them to fav or | 

action,” President Hill-|} 

The matter will be dis-| 

the Student-Faculty Coun-| 

| 

Junior English Test 
  

have not taken the 

Test will meet in 

orium 6:30 p.m., Octo- 

s exam. 

to bring a pen and 

nk and paper will be 

y student using a pen- 

paper is illegible will be 

ke a make up test. 

or excuses must be clear- 

Kilpatrick, chairman of the 

Usage Committee. Excused 

will take the exam from 

to 5:60 p.m., Friday, Octo- 

v he 
sh 

minutes will be alloted for 

which will be a theme of 

approximately two pages. 

sen from one of three given topics. 

The test this year is a complete 

change. The purpose is to show an 

adequate ability in formal expository 

writing using standard grammer 

nd formal sentences. This in ac- 

ordance with the stress on “quelity 

education.” This exam is given yearly 

j vords, 

| ramics. 

| field 

  the English Usage Committee, ® 
college-wide organization. 

cil at its regular meeting Tuesday 
night | 

The petitioners, who hope to have| 
by October 15, 
e coming in rap- 

signatories is Gov- 
ernor Nelson Rockefeller who signed 
che letter white campaigning in the 
Detroit area last week. | 

Faculty opinion seems to be that} 
ifting ban doesn’t actually 

change ation very much; a 

still needs the 

Ny. Among ¢ 

the 

the 

student organization 
  

Faculty Displays 
Raw! Art Exhibit awi Art EXnipl | 

The public 1s I 

Faculty Art Exhibit on display in the! 

Raw] Buildng Zuring the month of 

October. 

Included in the exhibit are the 
works of Dr. W. B. Gray, director of 

the Art Department; Dr. Bruce Car- 

M. T. Gordley; Dr. Leon Jacob- 

son; Thomas Mims; Paul R. Minnis; 
Francis L. Neel; Donald Sexauer; 
John C. Merritt, graduate assistant. 

A variety of expression and medi- 

ums are presented. In the firsc floor 

lobby are sculptures, jewelry, and ce- 

Paintings, drawings and oth 

er works are in the third floor gal- 

ter 

ey. ; 
“The different interpreta- 

tions of art represented in the Art 

Department offer a great variety of 
students studying in tne 

E.C.C.” stated Dr. 

many 

for 

of art 

Carter. 

At the entrance to the Raw! Build- 

ing is an eight foot sculpture of a 

woman, by Mr. Crawley, done in ce- 

ment. This work is typical of his in- 

terest in the Leauty of ideal forms. 

Another of Mr. Crawley’s works is a 

painting, intricately detailed. It was 

ieved by app!ying one color, scrap- 

ping with a knife, and applying an- 

cther color. This raised painting give: 

it a three dimensional quality. The 

method used is one similar to that 

of 17th Century French impression- 

ists. 
A painting of two colorful chickens 

vith a story-book look is one of Mr. 

Neel’s contributions. They are very 

styilized and pattern-like. His reason 

behind this picture? He wanted to do 

an abstraction about something with 

which he was familiar. 

One of Mr. Mims’ paintings done 

in brilliant orange and rust colors, is 

called “Auschwitz” It is his inter- 

pretation of a German crematorium. 

Also on display is one of a series of 

nine which he did for his thesis. 

choice   
invited to visit the! 

  Mr. Gordley, who is concerned with 

the spontaneous quality of drawing, 

has in the exhibition an interpretive 

drawing of the woods across from 

his home. 

“Troop Transport,” a linoleum cut 

by Dr. Carter, is significant in socia! 

meaning. It is one of a series which 

he is doing in connection with a 

mural he will paint next year. 

sponsorship of a “responsible” person 
such as a dean or department head 
before it can extend an invitation to 
any speaker. Therefore the power to 
approve a camovus lecturer still rests 
with the faculty and administration 
according to history professor Al- 
fred Kelley.—Sources: Wayne State 
Collegian, The Michigan Daily. 

  
Student Center Plans 
Homecoming Banquet 

The Homecoming Banquet for all 
| Baptist students and alumni will be 
leld at 5:30 on October 15 at the 
Baptist Student Center. 

The program will emphasize the 
alumni with Dr. John Horn speaking 
on “How Training in BSU Helps To- 
ward One’s Vocation. 

Special music will be provided by 
Carolyn Hinton and other students. 

The cost of the Banquet will be 
eighty-five cents. Tickets can be 
bought now from the BSU Director, 
Dwight Fickling or Dorothy Flynn.} 

Year’s Total 
examinations, Beginning with the 
1961 term next year, all state sup- 
ported institutions will give the scho- 
lastie aptitude section of the College 
Roard Examnation, 

Nominees Attend 
Dinner Meeting 

A dinner meeting Tuesday night 
honored the campus nominees for 

Woodrow Wilson graduate fellow- 
ships. Attending the meeting, in addi- 
tion to the nominees, were the heads 

f the departments from which the 
nominees were the head of the depart- 
ments from which the nominees were 
selected, Dr. James Tucker and ‘Dean 
Robert L. Holt, who presided. 

In addition to instructions con- 
cerning application for the fellowship, 
the nominees were also informed that 
they would have to take the Graduate 
Record examination. The followship 
is highly competitive and candidates 
will be judged according to their 
seores, 

Nominations from this campus in- 
cluded Tom Jackson, Sherry Maske, 
Richard Lewis Humphrey, and Bar- 
bara Waters, English Department; 
Carolyn Hintor, Music Department; 
and George Rofus Hughes, Psychol- 
ogy Department. 

Designed to reduce a nation-wide 
rhortage of qualified college teach- 
ers, the program annually awards 
1,000 fellowships for first year grad- 
uate study at any university of the 
recipient’s choice in the United States 
or Canada. 
Woodrow Wilson graduate fellow- 

ships are open to college graduates 
mainly in the humanities and social 
studies. Both men and women are eli- 
gible, and there is no limit on the 
age of the candidate or on the number 
of years he may have been out of cul- 
lege. Those who receive awards are 
not asked to commit themselves to 
college teaching, but merely to “coa- 
sider it seriously” as a possible career. 

The program, designed to encour- 
age college seriors of outstanding 
ability to study for advanced degrees 
with faculty jobs as their goal, is 
administered by the Woodrow Wilson 
National Fellowship Foundation und- 
er a “$24,500,000 five year grant 
from the Ford Foundation. 

Placement Director Distributes 
Annual Of Job 
Tips on what to say to the inter- 

viewer as well as a listing of the 
job opportunities normally available 
from some 1,890 employers are con- 
tained in the College Placement An- 
nual which is now being distributed 
by Jack Edwards, Director of the 
Campus Placement Bureau. 

The Annual, the official, non-profit 
occupational directory of the Region- 
al Placement Associations, indicates 
that the job picture for the 1960-61 
recruiting year will be a bright one, 
vith companies listing ever heavier 
needs for both technical and non- 
technical personnel. 

East Carolina is one of more than 
700 colleges throughout the United 
States and Canada to participate in 
the distribution of the Annual to 
seniors who are registered with the 
Placement Service. In addition, thi 
year speciallysmarked editions will 
be available to alumni requesting ad- 
vice from their placement office and. 
through the cooperation o the Depart- 
ment of Defense, to men being sep- 
arated from the Armed Services. Here 

Opportunities 
on the campus, the Amnual may be 
obtained at Room 203, Administra- 
tion Building, upon completion of reg- 
istration. 

Demand continues high, the Annual 
reveals, for chemists, with 805: com- 
pany listings; sales, 688 listings; and 
business administrators, 492 listings. 
Other fields categorised in the book 
ange from accounting, through claim 

adjusting, home eonomics, liberal 
arts, mathematics, and therapy to 
veterinary medicine. In all, there are 
more than 10,000 company occupa- 
tional cross-references. 

In an introductory section, the An- 
nual counsels the job-seeking gradu- 
ate or senior on making his decision, 
as well as on training programs, let- 
ter writing, and the placement serv- 
ice itself. Special articles deal with 
slumni and veterans placement and 
jobs for women. 

Reflecting its increasing accept- 
ance as the official job-hunting di- 
rectory, the Annual has a record cir- 
culation this year of 195,000 copies 
and a growth in total pages to 416. 

  

Departmental meetings, with the exception of Music, Art, 
and Education, will be held tomight at the following times and 
places. 

Department 

Business 

English 

Foreign Language 

Geography 
Health and Physical Ed. 
Home Economics 
Industrial Arts 
Library Science 

Math 
Nursing 

Science 
Social Studies 

Wright Auditorium 
Austin Auditorum 
Graham—Room 1€2 
Graham—Room 20@ 
Gym 
Flanagan Auditorium 
Flanagan Auditorium 
Staff Room 
Library Auditorium 
Rawl—Reoom 130 
McGinnis 
Austin Auditorium 

Place Time 
7:00 

lina ¥ 

Basketball Preview- 
=pPKeview of the 1960-61 East Caro- 

basketball team will be con- 
Saturday morning at 10 a. m. 

in Memorial Gymnasium. Coach Earl 
Smith ii 

  

This year’s big homecoming week- 
end will begin Friday night with a 
bon fire and pep rally at 7:00. 

The EC Band and the cheerleaders 
will be present at this event, which 
will. take place on the street behind 
the training school and near the back 
gates of the football stadium. 

Immediately following the pep ra!- 
ly. the college dance band, The Col- 
cegians, will entertain at an informal 
street dance at the Maintenance Build- 
ing at 8:00 p. m. 

The Homecoming Parade begins 
at 11:45 on Saturday morning. The 
line-up of the parade will be in the 
parking lot on East Campus between 
the Training School and the tennis 
courts. Places will be assigned in 
pumber. 

All organizations entering the pa- 
rade must have floats in line by 10:15! 
a.m. Each float will have a number 
and a startin position. The cars 
carrying the sponsors will be in line 
by 11:15. Siges for sponsor’s cars 
will be furnished Saturday mornirg 
at the parade formation. 

The bands and drill team will a!so 
have a number and position. These 
groups must ke ready to march by 
11:16, 

Pre-game activities will begin at 
1:30. After all of the sponsors have 
been presented, the Homecoming 
Queen will be arnounced and crowned. 

Kick-off time for the game he- 
tween the “Pirates” and the “Cats” 
of Western Carolina will be at 2:00. 

Following the football game the 
College Union will have an Open 
House at 5:00, for alumni, students, 
and guests. At 6:30 the Society of 
Buccaneers will have a Dutch Sup- 
per in the North Cafeteria. 

Les Elgart and his Orchestra wi!! 
present a concert at 7:45 in Wright 
Building. At °:45 the Homecoming 
Dance will begin. 

After the presentation of sponsors 
at 10:00 p.m., at the dance Saturday 
night, the awards for floats and dorm 
decorations will be presented. 

Late permission until 12:30 Satur- 
day night, has been granted to a!! 
the women stulents. attending the 
homecoming dance in Wright Audi- 
torium. This means that women stu- 
dents must be in the dormitory by 
12:30, 

Dean White explained that the la- 

YDE Announces 
Yearly Activities, 
Fleet Officers 

The Young Democrats Club of East 
Carolina launched election year activ- 
ities recently electing officers to lead 
them in their efforts to promote the 
national and state Democratic tickets. 

Officers elected were: Bill Hamil- 
ton, President; Glenn Jernigan, Vice- 
President; Bob Paines, Secretary; and 
Jim Kirkland Treasurer. Other mem- 
bers of the Eecutive Council are Bob 
Chistesen and Coleman Norris. 

Guest of the club on Tuesday even- 
ing, October 4, was Matt Reese, co- 
erdinator of the Democratic campaign 
in North Carolina. 

After having dinner with a group 

of YDC members he spoke at the 
regularly sheduled club meeting, urg- 
img members to “be enthusiastic” in 
their support of the Democratic can- 
didates. 

On Thursday afternoon, October 6, 
fourteen Young Democrats and their 
advisor, Dr. Kathleen Stokes, traveled 

{to Williamston to attend the First 
Congressional District Democratic 
Rally. They participated in the func- 
tion at which Dr. I. Beverly Lake and 
gubernatorial candidate Terry San- 
ford were the main speakers. 

Immediate plans of the group are 
to attend and to assist at the Demo- 
cratic Rally in Wilson on October 13 
at which time former President Harry 
Truman will be the central figure. 

      

ter time was ranted with the under- 
standing that this request would be 
the only one given and this time only, 
ince it effected the entire student 

hody. No single organization will be 
sranted late permission in the future. 

Dean White eso stressed that rid- 
ing privileges will end at 12:00, since 
parental permission blanks state 
12:00 as the deadline for riding. 

From 12:00 until 12:30 the “Col- 
legians” will provide the dance ma- 

:30 a.m.—Board of Trustees meet- 
ing with Pres‘dent Leo W. Jenkins 
in the Administration Building. 

9 30 a.m.—Coffee Hour with Pit!- 
Greenville Alumni chapter hosting 
in the \Alumni-Faculty Building. 
6 am <= Homecoming Parade 

from campus into Greenville Busi- 
ness District. 

12:30 p.m.—Luncheon in North Cafe- 
teria. 

2:00 p.m.—Pre-Game festivities in 
College Stadium. 

Notice 
Lee H. Blackwell, Balfour rep- 

resentative, will be in the College 
Union on Thursday, Oct. 20 to 
take orders fer class rings. Hours 
9 am— 4 p.m. 

  

Miss Senora Moore PiK A house- 
mother was taken to Pitt Mem- 
orial Hospital Tuesday morning. 
Reports from the hospital indi- 
cate she is suffering from a stroke 
and is on the critical list.   

ites all students and alumni 

ight 
| Elgart's Band To Climax Weekend 
Activities With Concert, Dance 

2:30 p.m.—Football Game: ECC vs 
Western Carolina. 

Following the game: 
Open House in the College Union, 
Raw! Building (Business Education 
Department), and the various stu- 
dent centers. 

6:30 p.m—Fall meeting of Society 
of Buccaneers in North Cafeteria. 

6:30 p.m— Fraternity and Sorority 
dinners (to be announced). 

7:45 p.m.—Concert featuring Les El- 
gart and His Band in Wright Audi- 
torium. 

8:45 p.m. -Homecoming Dance with 
the rt Land playing in Wright 
Auditorium, 

Election Results 
Tuesday’s freshmen elections ended 

in a victory for a few, and a run-of 
tor several candidates. Bil] Eyer- 
nan was victorious in the president- 
ial race against Lewis Latham and 
Willie Hunt. 

Bryan Bennet and Robert Chris- 
ensen, vice-president candidates, were 

in the run-offs, held today, along with 
the two girls vieing for secretary, Dee 
>mith and Linda Whitworth. 

Polly Bunting was selected to fill 
the treasurer’s position. The men and 
women senators will be decided in to- 
day’s run-off. Tommy Mallison aad 
Pill Moore (men’s senator) and Myr- 
ue Weaver and Marsha Whitworth 
{women’s senator) were running for 
-hese offices. The final decisions were 
too late fer publication. 

Baptist Student Convention Begins 
In Winston-Salem, 
Winston-Salem will be the site of | 

the thirty-first annual convention of 
the North Carolina Baptist Student 
Union, November 4-6, 1960. 

From thirty colleges universities 
and professional schools, a thousand 
students are” expected to gather to 
uear addresses by outstanding speak- 
«rs, discuss the theme “Committed 
To His Lordshin,” and to enjoy fel- 
lewship with each other. 

BSU President Sue Lassiter says 
that reservations will be made by 
October 24, for approximately 75 stu- 
dents from East Carolina. 

A North Carolina BSU Choir will 
be composed of students from across 
the state, according to the East Car- 
oling BSU Music Chairman Carolyn 
Hinton. \Application for membership 
may be made through Miss Hinton. 
The Winston Salem College Choir 
directed by Dr. J. A. Dillard will 
sing at the opening session. 

Speakers include Dr. Hale Moody, 
Southern Seminary, Louisville; Dr. 
Jack Noffsinger. Winston Salem; Dr. 
John McClanahan, Hope, Arkansas; 
Mr. Hiward Bramlette, Southwide 
Student Department, Nashville, Ten- 
nessee. Thirty discussion groups will 
convene for two periods to share and 
discuss ideas related to the addresses 
on the theme. 

Faculty and administrative staff 
will hear and discuss an address on 

  

November 4-6 
“Basic Presuppositions of the Chris 
tian Teacher.” The group will meet 
on Saturday in the Magnolia Room 
at Wake Forest College and Dr. Dav- 
id Smiley of the College will preside 
at the lunchein. 

Other features of the Convention 
include a dramatic presentation by 
the Women’s College BSU, a theme 
interpretation by the Duke Univer- 
sity BSU, interest centers and wor- 
ship led by Wake Forest BSU, and 
4 business session during which a 
budget for the LISTEN funds for 
vorld needs will be adopted. 
Names of those who plan to attend 

and a $1.00 registration fee each 
should be in the Department of Stu- 
dent Work, 301 Hillsboro Street, Ra- 
leigh, by October 24. Mary Lu Nich- 
olson is in charge of sending in res- 
ervations from this campus. Over- 
night accommodations will be pro- 
vided by the host church, First Bap- 
tist Church of Winston Salem, with- 
cut charge to students. 

ANNOUNCEMENT 

Seniors who are registered with 
the Placement Service and are in- 
terested in teaching in the Norfolk 
County Schools, Virginia, should 
sign up for interviews at 203 Ad- 
ministration hy 10:00 a.m. Satur- 
day, October 15. 
  

‘Plans are also being made to send a/# 
large delegation to the state YDC 
convention in Raleigh on October 20- 
22. 

The club invites any students in- 
terested in the Democratic Party or 
in better government to attend the 
next meeting. 

The club meets each Tuesday night 
at seven o’clock in Austin Auditorium. 

FOREIGN STUDENTS TEA 
Pictured above are (reading left to 
Pierre Benmouyal (France), Mrs.  
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Everyone Must Support Employment Of | 
Pirates Club If We 
Expect The Same Favor 

This year, with well over four thousand 
students on campus and in the town of 
Greenville, the local merchants should pros- 
per as never before. 

Many of us sometimes fail to realize the 
economic influence East Carolina has on the 
town of Greenville. We have noticed the 
town during holidays when the ECC stu- 
dents are gone. The change is amazing. On 
Evans street, ‘parking places are plentiful, 
and Fifth street is almost like a ghost town. 
One merchant recently has said, “The town 
and my business dies when the college turns 
out.” 

In view of the tremendous amount of 
money these merchants realize from the col- 
lege each year (not counting what the college 
buys collectively, such as utilities, office sup- 
plies, ete.) there are still many merchants 
who refuse to support the college. 

The Pirates Club is un organization of 
merchants who, realizing the value of the 
college to Greenville, aid and support the 
college when needed. These men and their 
firms contribute time, effort and money to 
East Carolina. They are sincere in their con- 
cept that the interaction between the college 
ind the town should be equally beneficial. 
They are interested in East Carolina and 
want to see it grow. 

On the other hand, there are a few 
greedy and thoughtless people in Greenville 
who feel, “I'll take these students for all I 
can today because if one is offended, there 
are always plenty more.” They have no in- 
terest in the college except for the money 
they can get from us now. They are not even 
good business men because they are not look- 
ing to the future. They do not realize their 
growth, in large part, depends on the growth 
of the college. In essence, they want to take 
the golden eggs without feeding the goose. 

With this in mind, we take the oppor- 
tunity to urge all college students to learn 
and support those merchants who support 
and take an interest in us; and to ignore those 
who take us for “suckers.” 

Americans Owe Debt 
To Freedom Of Press 

Individual Americans, as everyone 
knows, enjoy more contro! over their person- 
al lives, more control over their government 
and are less subject to the whims of those 
in authority over them than almost any other 
people in the whole history of the human 
race. 

Unfortunately, this is not a state of af- 
fairs that will perpetuate itself unassisted. There always are evil or misguided people 
who, from either the worst or best of inten- tions, try to subvert other people’s liberties to their own desires. 

A healthy dose of public exposure is the 
first step in defending against corrupt or crackpot schemes, whether they develop in government, busin labor unions or any other segment of society. Providing this ex- posure is one of the most important jobs of a free press in a free country. 

National Newspaper Week, Oct. 15-21, offers a reminder of this vital function. It offers also a good opportunity for both the makers and readers of American newspapers to re- er how well they are doing their job. —I. P. §, 
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From the “Rubayait of Omar Khayam.” 
“The moving finger writes, and, having writ, 
Moves on; nor all your piety nor wit, 
Shall lure it back to cance] half a Mine. 
Nor all your tears wash out a word of it.” 

translated by E. Fitagerald. $$$ ein by E Fitegerald, 

Bookkeeper Causes 
Puch Confusion 

By PAT FARMER 
In recent weeks much hes been said 

concerning the policies of our stu- 
dent government. The center of the 
controversy has come to revolve a- 
round the office of treasurer, Many 
students do not understand what his 
specific duties are; neither do they 
understand the reason behind the 
newly created position of bookkeeper 
for the SGA. 

First, let’s start with the purpose 
of the SGA as defined in Article IT 
of the constitution: “The purpose of 
the SGA shall be to give the students 
the privilege of and training in self 
government; to organize and direct 
the affairs of the students of East 
Carolina College; and, through its 
cfficers and committees, to represent 
the students in all relations with the 
admini-tration, and the faculty, and 
the community. The SGA shall further 
trive to develop student honor and 

to promote a sense of personal re- 
sponsibility in the students of the 
College. The SGA may participate 
in national, state, and regional sti- 
dent government movements.” The 
purpose seems relatively clear, doesn’t 
it? Except maybe the phrase “self- 
government” should have been delet- 
ed, 

Now let’s go to Article VI, section 
concerning the duties of the treas- 

urer: “(a) the treasurer shali collect 
and have charge of all funds collected 
by the SGA. (b) shall conduct the 
financial transaction of the SGA. 
(c) shall serve as chairman of a budg- 
et committee. (d) shall make a quar- 
terly report to the student senate 
and on his retirement of office, an 
annual report to a budget committee. 
(e) shall submit his books for annual 
audit.” Now that we know what the 
treasurer's duties consist of—we 
come back to question of why a book- 
keeper for the SGA? Simple—because 
of the awkward tem of bookkeep- 

treasurers, the : 
that it was necessary for them to 
step in and take control of the situa- 

tion in order to protect the student 
body from its own stupidity. .. . 

But now the questions .. . 
Do current events mean that the 

office of treasuver will be abolished, 
Does it mean that the SGA Treas- 

urer will continue to be salaried sim- 
ply because it is neces y for him 
to sign a check in order to legalize 
it? After all, it would be simpler and 
easier for the new bookkeeper to 
sign the checks when they are writ- 
ten. 

Now the huffing and puffing comes 
from the student body ... “Why, they 
scream, does the administration treat 
us like children?” Answer: because 
we act like children... For eight 
months, the student body shows no 
interest in the affairs of their “state” 
end then comes the ninth month- 
they respond long enough to vote in 
office individuals who have no idea 
what they are doing there, except 
that they are popular and have lots 
of friends... . 

But every now and then, an individ- 
ual with gumption comes along who 
wants to improve the student body’s 
lot . . . What happens??? He is 
squelched—squelcdhed by the glory 
individuals who are satisfied with 
the student’s lot—after all they are 
hig people on campus. We here at 
East Carolina have a great deal to 
be proud of and to say to the world, 
we are mature college adults 

“America is that wonderful land 
where it’s trash, to sit on the porch 
in your undershirt, but gracious liy- 
ing if you’ve got nothing on but 
shorts.’—Tom Dodds. 
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Are The College Bookstores Suffering 
A Loss? If So, What Are The Reasons? 
“A university is a community of 

scholars, old and young, and its funec- 

tion is to provide scholars with the 

environment and the facilities con- 

lucive to the discovery and trans- 
niission of ideas and to their applica- 

lion to the larger community, present 

und future.” This definition 
cluded in Professor Henry S. Com- 

nager’s article, “Is Ivy Necessary” 
in the September 17 edition of the 
Saturday Review. For those of you 

vho will, we urge you to read it} for 
those of you who will not, we shall 
attempt to share with you a few of 

choice statements 
concerning colleges and universities. 

“The bookshop is as essential a 
part of the university community as 
the library or the laboratory, and a 
sood deal more important than the 

bookshops should be 
niaintained even at a LOSS, just as 
‘ney maintain theatres and musie 
and athletics at a loss.” Frankly, we 
would like some PROOF that our 

bookst s are suffering a 
oss. Is there a student here so dead 
who never to himself has said, “Who 
the hell is making all the profit?” How 
many students have gone to classes 
uarter after quarter bookless be- 

e the prices of texts are so out- 
rageous? Have you noticed the thirty- 
five cent paperbacks automatically 
&o up to forty five cents when they 
are required for a course? Paying the 
price is one thing; trying to sell the 
one-quarter-used book is something 
else. If there is a loss, it is the stu- 
dent’s not the “bookstlore’s” with 
their glorified money changers who 
“don’t know from nuthin” about why 
books cost so much. Come on, let’s 
hear the excuses; there must be plen- 
ty in stock. 

“The cafeterias with their clang, 
bang, clutter; the antiseptic but tire- 
some food; service reluctant; popu- 
lar musie piped in relentessly to 
drown out all conversation. If there 
must be musie why not Beethoven and 

is in- 

Mr. Commage?’s 

tadium 

college 

LITTLE MAN ON.CAMPUS 
See 

<—BoaeEZ Zs 2, “a | 
3 awe S- ll 

O SAID: HE WONT CHANGE A f. TO wales His Pee PROM Meme Dee" 

By KAY McLAWHON 
Bach?” 

We are in favor with those students 
who are working their way through 
college in the cafeterias, but most of 
them give the impression that they 
had rather be doing most anything 
else, so why don’t they change to 
some other type of self-help work? 
After all there ere enough from which 
to choose. But no. They stand and 
wait like vultures while you eat, and 

as soon as you have finished the last 
bite of dessert and are about to smoke 
that delicious cigarette, suddenly they 
are upon you slinging pink and blue 
non-chip earthen ware into the cart. 

We recommend that if there must 
be noise piped in the cafeterias !et 
it at least be ckin to music, that if 
there must be vulture-types in the 
vafeterias, let them at least be equip- 
ped with economy size hankies. 

Students Express Opinions On 
Rush Week, Proposed Chapel 

Dear Editor, 

Rush week is over, and speaking for 
the fraternities, I am sure we are 
glad. It was quite successful and was 
clearly the biggest ever. I feel that 
even this, however, is only the begin- 
ving. Rush will get bigger and better 
each year. 

I have heard members of more than 
one fraternity comment that the cali- 
her of boy which came through this 
fall was definitely the highest yet. 

Frankly speaking, the rushees are 
getting “sharper” all the time. The 
manner of dress, vocabulary, general 
appearance, and “social adeptness” of 
boys coming thru has increased many 
“old. Now, for the first time, I feel 
we can favorably compare our poten- 
tial fraternity men with those of the 
big four and other more traditional 
schools. This points up to the fact 
that our schoo! is drawing in ever 
ever increasing amount of boys from 
the larger, more urbanized areas of 
this and surrounding states . ; 

Whether it was intentional or un- 
intentional, the author of an article 
in last week’s paper made a rather 
pointed comment, which seemed to im- 
tly that top position in rush is deter- 
mined by greatness of members. I 
believe this to be a rather shallow 
remark by a young man who should 
be aware that quality, not quantity 
constitutes the exclusiveness of be- 
longing to a fraternal organization. 

This is not meant that we fratern- 
ity men are, or should be aloof, rath- 
tr, we should maintain what the 
founding fathers of the more con- 
servative fraternities held in quite 
high esteem. 

A rushee is viewed from the pre 
spective as to whether his Personality 

and taste will coincide with that of 
the group he aspires to become a part. 
Various groups each having dissimi- 
lar qualifications for a prospective 
brother cannot be judged as to top 
position by the number of rushees 
they pledge. Therefore dear readers, 
co not be confused by numbers. Keer. 
in mind that quality is the ideal 
ought after. 

Sincerely, 
Darrell 

Cluttered Mall? 
Dear Editor, 

Hurst 

I feel that it is imperative to the 
future atmosphere and beauty of this 
college campus to oppose and to seek 
opposition from all students and fac- 
ulty members to certain details of a 
project now under way at East Caro- 
lina. 

The September 29th issue of the 
East Carolinian contained a front- 
page story concerning the Proposed 
erection of a chapel on the college 
mall. I do not oppose the building of @ chapel as such; it could possibly 
add a great deal to the aesthetic 
4ualities of the institution The object- 
tion which is being raised is to the 
erection of any structure on the col- tege mall. The mall and the arbore- tum have served as places of spiritual and psychological elevation of the stu- dents. This atmosphere could not be possible if the area is cluttered by blobs of man made masonry. 5 May I take this opportunity to urge the backers of this movement to reconsider the location of their nroject for the good of the college. 

Sincerely 
Donald Ray Lennon 

‘Collage’ Editors Plan To Stimulat 
Interests To Higher Creative Levels 
One of the best and most unusual 

magazines to hit the newsstands in 
a long time is Collage, which is pub- 
lished especially for the entertaiu- 
nent of college students, 
Concerning the Mmagazine’s inten- 

tions, David Preiss, one of the editors, 
says “we have blared our editor- 
ial purpose far and wide: to stimu- 
late the interests of college students 
to higher intellectuat and creative ievels. We will not attempt to pro- 
vide you with meterial because we 
know you are extremely interested in ft—we want to introduee you to 

This bi-monthly magazine reviews the Intest books, fietion and non-fic. 

tion, records, movies 
some of the most 

ever printed, and 
designed to revive 

and plays; has 
hilarious cartoons 
introduces postry 
the realm of poe- 
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Informal 
Smoker? 

Unpopular Presidential 
Candidate Viewed As 

“Spoiled Rich Man’s Son’ 
By PAT HARVEY 

Last week’s newspaper mentioy 
thing about the fraternities havin, 
smokers. This certainly vives one 

fused look y, hen he tries to pict 
smoker .. . maybe they use half ¢,,; 

ette holders and gold-plated ashtray 
this really proves that frat men d 
isoney unwisely sometimes. 

A certain freshman runnin 
asked how the freshmen wou!d ch 

esident. ‘to opinions were deli, 
the worried candidate—(1) Willi: 

‘cause His neme is more ¢ 
is would «in because h 

lot. So what in the world 

After hearing reports on 
who participated in the National 
Exam, it makes one wonder if any 
it. Many of the volunteering fac, 
seem to volunteer enough help. Sor 
little iteris such as when to start 
to stop. And many of the cont 
stuck on the first question ... 
is pretty important also. 

nam 

movie 
war's 

shootin’ 

offering, presents a gory portrait 0} a 
activities. If stories about blood 
death and concentration camps are 
of entertainment this should be a tr 
the week. But if you like the love an 
riage bit, finese this one. 

There are some pretty nasty 
about the SGA circulating amony th: 
organizations. Seems that student 
$15 activities fee, but don’t know 
used for. If the big organizations 
a sizable share, who do 

A couple weeks ago I mentione 
. or so I thought and stil] think 

Kennedy is not a popular pres t 
didate with the masses. Now acc: 
weekly publication, Human Event 
even popular in the Senat 
members put it this way: “Jack 
spoiled rich man’s son. He think 
on earth is here solely to do for hir 
curly-headed little kid is nv 
Throughout his entire carcer, he 
that he will run roughshod ove: 
gets in his way.” It also stated t! 
fauver rates lower in the Senate’: 
poll. All this only proves that so: 
aren’t wrong all the time. 

croy 

Don’t forget to send bac k 
you didn’t order find the ke 
winter clothes suitcase... start read 
book you have to report on tomi 

Faculty File Could 
Solve Many Problems 

Last year, if we remem} 
faculty members here were eval 1k 
classes through the medium of anno1 
questionnaires. 

This was a worthwhile project, f else can one learn of his mistakes a 
nesses. if not through constructive 
Would it not be a good idea to ¢ 
program this year, thus giving 
body an Opportunity to point out 
faculty members weaknesses and ings in their teaching procedure 

Perhaps a file could be kept o1 ulty member and the rey 
pared. If some professor's 
to show poor class response, : 
students, departmental hé ads, 
administrators could study the ommend changes. 2 

East Carolina, just as does a! has on its faculty some profes only mediocre. This program weed them out. 
« 

The administration announced last wee 
an extra 30 minutes would be allo 

late Permission for girls attending 
mecoming dance this year. This was d 

the understanding that since this pr 
> benefited the whole student body it wo mM effect for homecoming only and ¥ 

not to be requested by individual organ 
tions at any other time this year. At the same time it was made clear th 

girls who attended parties or dances Og 
oe Would have to be in at the regull 
me unless they left their individual pst 

farly and came to the SGA sponsored ¢ or the remaining 30 minutes. a fori seems a bit 

a part 

@uca  
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me p «Under the Erection and supervis-;time element involved in using any creative aspects of the world around 
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vit pessimisti npus literary mag 
vid Buecaneer, fun veekly but I’m not sure i arted ir irolinian, Reb 1958 by a groun 

ies will permit it yet.” tudents who realized the need at 
‘Bite Riecauaer |Past Carolina College of an outlet 

‘An annual i a record in picture| “9” student expression through erea- 
» school year.” stated writing e magazine was to 

and to} Buddy Kilps k, 
tudent| This year’ 

ind word ¢ 

Buccaneer editor.| consist entirely of student contribu 

edition, containing re in the form of short stories, 

Boat lor pictures the y previva k review work, critical 
advisor } photography, and personal n- 

tudent | roduced 
Dean of | “The Rebel” had the 

is composed of apy | 1 lems of a young publica- 
rembers, among them 0 » jack of funds made print- 

Wes ftom eaale Clase, gerv-| ine oi ye number of copies im- 
editors for their respective| ;ossible, therefore only a minority of 

eached. The small 
iration of President Leo| *t working with few contributior 

vill have a complete lay-| !'" € sues the first yea 

Buccaneer. Mr. Ki!-| By It nereased interest in the 
f f vubled the staff and 

ributions from stu-   ty. Many more 

are of the literar 

rough wider cir- 

> Rebel.” 
ES 
etal 5 eam 

“We'll use this one,” decides Buddy Kilpatrick while Walter Faulkner 
holds a recent group photograph taken for the Bucc aneer 

inves in the 1960-61 version of 
The Rebe The addition of nation 

advertising ‘as made possible an 

representative from creased nu r of pages and a 

standing, 

ed by students and! Joe Henry, 
ts. This year the| Delmar of Cl arlotte which is publish-| growth rculation of 3,600. New 

Chic 
‘ | srsonal » be- ok, is working with the ersonal i 

roversial fig 
November 14 

» judged 
Photography By 

ene Jim Kirkland 
© of “The Rebel” 

Copy By 

-atsy Ellictt 

Ruth Johnson 

Dee Smith 

tL represent 
60 Buccaneer 

RS complete 

students. 

Pat Farmer, seated, ard Jesse Moore are shown coypreading materials for 
the first issue of the Rebel. 

HEADLINING .. . calls the attention of newspaper 
fal! members, pictured left to right: Monty Mills, 
Marcelle Vogel, Pat Harvey, and Betty Maynor, 

on, Patsy Elliott, and Jim Kirkland confer on the 

publications feature 

\\N ERROR Proofreading the copy for the newspaper is a tedious task. 

Staff members catch an error. 

Editor Roy Martin, left, and Nelson Dudley, Art Editor, discuss the possi- 
bilities of a sketch for the Fall issue of the Rebel.  
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Caruth Competition Continues 
For SMU Alma Mater Theme 

Southern Methodist University has 
announced that the Caruth Competi- 
tion for the composition of a univer- 
sity alma mater-type song will be 
extended for one more year. The con- 
test is open to any professional or 
amateur composer in this country and 

Methodist University. 

cal committee to be appointed each 
year by the president of Southern|tains a family tradition of interest 

On the basis of this judging awards 
of $1000 for first prize, $600 for sec- 
ond prize, and $300 for third prize 
will be made to entries in June of 

Methodist University, Caruth main- 

jin SMU that goes back to the uni- 
versity’s founding, when W. W. Car- 
uth, Sr. donated a substantial amount 
of land to the new school. 

Amateurs Qualify 

Reactions O 
By BETTY MAYNOR 

When the student body became 
aware last year of the proposed 
change to the semester system, var- 
ied opinions were heard both pro and 
con, 

The plan to put the semester sys- 
tem in effect wis officially begun this 
tall, when a faculty committee was 
appointed with Dr. John H. Horne, 

CAROLINIAN 

which concern his department speci-| 

fieally. “I think it will help solve 

the problem of freshmen English. 

With the semester system, we would 

be able to get all of the freshmen 

into the English classes for the en- 

tire year. Now there is a large pee 

of the freshmen class not enrolled 

im an English class,” he said. ; 

Mr. Donald Hayes, of the Music 

Proposal 
}Home Economics S|

 

the following advantages — 
| 

vantages for 0h igen ng 

“I believe ‘a , a 

most desirable length of et 

dent teaching. ! do not thin | 

student should have an entire a | 

ee in student teaching. That — 

yreatly increase the number ai i 

dent teaching centers needed and r 

THURSDAY, OCTOBER 

Vary 
dent teacher must make ma 
ments to a new and ofte, 
situation. I can see ¢ 
of the first semester 4 
undesirable period 4 

13, 199) 

broken by bot) 
Christmas holida 

Advantages ich 
ed included, “Two ins 
iimes a year for 

1 ubject matter) examinations and send F registrar, chairman. Department faculty, said, “I think t (duce regen oad take in | If the semester systey In an effort to gain an over-all pic-| would be beneficial in certain respec peer e I do not believe that one- urday classes, 4 ture of campus opinions on the pro-|and I think that the benefits would hoe UE - rk is a long enough could be us 
posed change, students and faculty outnumber the il! effects. The change ee for student teaching. The stu- ‘ageously.’ were asked their reactions to the an-| would not modify my work to any peri ji --— -—- — — nouncement, yreat degree. However, I feel quite 

Bob Ward, junior, said, “I hope strongly that our students’ wishes 
they wait until I get out because it’l!| should be adhered to if their wishes 
really mess me up.” do not conflict tco strongly with over- 

| Freddie Skinner, sophomore, com- all educational zequirements.” 
mented, “I like the quarter system Dr. Bessie MeNiel, head 
because it allows one to get in more | —————— 
subjects. Another thing, I dislike the 
idea of Saturday classes. The way Cam us Calendar 
my schedule is, I need two days a 
weck to recuperate.” 

“I don’t like it. The load on the 
student will be so much greater,” 
said Jimmy Moore, freshman. 

Nancy Coggins, sophomore, said, 
“I had rather learn a little about a 
lot of things, than a lot about a few ; 
things.” Aud., 7:00 p.m. 

z > Cs h “I don’t know too much about it. I] Sat., Oct. 15: Homecoming Day in command; Cadet “i nageaeinen ap z qs F ridge, Co!- |G , secretary; s. 
The Delta Zeta Chapter of Delta| think it would be good,” commented | 'ton., ee pte eas pang es ‘ae Rowe, historian; Ca- 

Oe EY Ini oom, 7: .m, Set. : ’ , 
t < rsity will be submitted to] W. W. Caruth, Jr., who is donat-| Sigma Pi held its fall smoker Thurs-| a Camabys srestnnsn- Ss ob 3 eee ere Men’s Doubles Table| det M. Sgt. Charles D. Bland, serge- 

EG ats Ga etition Committee at/ing the awards for the contest, is a] av, September 22 in their chapter Peggy Wood, sophomore, said, “It’s a . s 

the Caruth Compe s , =a os ‘ Tennis Tournement, College Union,| ant at arms; and Cadet S. Sgt. Ronald 

SMU each year by February 10. The}land planner and developer whose |*90m on Fifth and Contanche ae sie it tee i pete 7:00 p.m. : M. Crawley, treasurer. 
ries may he individuals’ composi- | grandfather was an early Dallas set-| Mr. Tom Reese, president of the ae hours: ail worked an the date|Wed., Oct. 19: After a victory in Durham = last 

sed by more than one|tler who at one time had holdings chapter, presided. pemneralp - f graduati F jee ae " Class, College year in the area C-2 competition, 
boration. In the spring |estimated at 19,000 acres in north; Delta Sigma Pi is extended by invi-|°f graduation. For the incoming stu- 

: - 6 5 i Fri., Oct. 21: Movie: “Seven Thieves,”|'Teams in Virginia, North Carolina, 

songs will be ‘udged by SMU alumni, | vard Graduate Schoo! of Business Ad- | in the Business Department. ; ate —, plier pets: at Nees G. Robinson, Austin Aud.,] and South Carolina, the East Caro- 
students and faculty and by a techni-' ministration, as well as Southern| The purpose of the Fraternity was ies P ras ‘ . 00 Ea 

= 
—-———~ | revealed to p-ospective pledges and| mg and probably help us get in the J ; aia a ae - ® 

jthe officers of the chapter were in-| Southern Conference.” Republican Ral'y, College Stadium, Dormitories Elect 
with Reese; Senior Vice President, Lloyd|*ystem. It would give the students] Sat., Oct. 22 Football _Game- eS 

orl r 
Mex Shoiman Lee; Vice President, Lloyd Williams;} more time to learn, especially the] vs Newberry, College Se gia = dueting 

Secretary, Jon Felton; Treasurer, Ted] slow learning students,” commented pin, otter the Game Beuce Borne icers or ear tailer pre 
McGee; ‘Historian, Ronnie Neal; and|-lim Willis, freshman, sored by the SGA, Wright Aud ; 

Loves of Dobie Gillis”, etc.) 

dvertiser 
Following this introductory period) #taphy Department commented, “I| lege Union TV Room, 7:00 p.m. elected for the presidency of New Chi Omega sorority served refresh-]see no objection to the quarter sys-|Wed., Oct. 26: Beginners’ Bridge| norm September twenty-sixth. Phil ments. Dancing, entertainment, and|tem. I like this system. If we are| Class, Collece Union TV Room,| ifarris was elected Vice President; fellowship set the mood of a most en- trying to get maximum use from our| 7:00 p.m. Marry Felton, Secretary; and Bobby 
Prospective pledges attended a] mester. On this system you go to Board Meeting, 8rd floor social dinner meeting Tuesday, September] school 11 months and have one month room, Wright Bldg., 6:30 p.m. 27 and were initially installed as| vacation. One suggested disadvantage] ECC Playhouse Performance: “The Pledges for Fall Quarter. Pledges for| of this system i3 that it deadens your} Philadelphia Story,” McGinnis ‘Aud., 

Koonee, Mac Burris, Joe Hudnell,| One member of the English Depart-| 'ri., Oct. 28: Halloween Masquerade Stewart Odhair, J. W. Moore, Char-| ment faculty, Dr. James Poindexter,| Ball, sponsored by Angel Flight les Hargett, and McCoy Dilday. commented on one of the advantages| and AFROTC, Wright Aud., 8:90 
p.m. 

Philadelphia Story,” McGinnis Aud., 
8:00 p.m. 

Sat., Oat. 29: Movie: “Sink The Bis- 
mark,” Kenneth More, Austin Aud., 

ECC Playhouse Performance: “The 
Philadelphia Story,” McGinnis Aud., 
8:00 p.m. 

Mon., Oct. 31: Duplicate Bridge, Col- 

RELIGIOUS EMPHASIS WEEK 
(October 31—November 2). 

a 
Jane Gurganus, Sarah Love, Kay Mar- e e ‘in, Irene Sain, and Janet Wescott. 

Elections for the Umstead Hall wing. Ine Officers for 1960-61 were held 

year the submitted] snd east Dallas. A graduate of Har-| ‘tion only to male students enrolled| (ents, freshmen and transfers, it} 7:00 p.m. which included all AF ROTC Drill 

troduced as follows: President, Tom| “I think I would like the semester} (in case of rain, Wright Aud.) 

(Author of “I Was a Teen-age Dwarf”, “The Many 

and other 
Chancellor, Charlie Munn. Dr. George C Martin of the Geo-| Mon., Oct. 24: Duplicate Bridge, Col-| Tim Bradley was unanimously " 

joyable smoker. plant, why not investigate the tri-|Thur., Oct. 27: College Union Student Denton, Treasurer. 

; Delta Sigma Pi are as follows: Gale] faculty.” 8:00 pm. 

ECC Playhouse Performance: “The 

7:00 p.m. 

lege Union TV Room, 7:00 p.m. 

Thursday night. The officers elected 

meeting is s 
3 p.m. in t 

torium. 
The Colle 

to citizens of other countries study-| each of the years 1961, 1962, and 1963. Amateur and professional com- ing at accredited colleges or, univer-| The nine prize-winning songs will posers throughout the nation are en- sities in the United States, with| then be eligible for the grand prize couraged to submit their original prizes to be awarded over a three-| of $1500, to be awarded in November, | alma mater-type songs to the Caruth ganized last year period totaling $7200 and a pos-| 1963. contest this year before the February ulty membe sible bonus of $2500. Additional $2500 (0 deadline. Fntries should be sub- held The addition of another year to If the grand prize-winning song | mitted in duplicate, with name and Ww the contest was made necessary by| should be adopted by Southern Meth- address on one copy and no identifi- — the fact that the judging committee | odist University as an official school / cation on the second copy, with 
cf the Caruth Composition met and} song, an additional award of $2500 words interlined between the staffs decided to withhold announcement of} will be made to it. : {and separate copies of the words in any prizes this year since the stan- Under these rales it would be Pos- verse form. 
lard of excellence that they antici-| sible for a song, winning first prize Further information is available 
pated in was not met./ during one of the competition years, | from, and all entries should be sent 
Original announcement of the three-jto win also the grand prize and to be‘ to: The Caruth Compettion, P. 0. Box year program was made in October, | awarded the $2500 bonus—so that|174, Southern Methodist University, cae one composition might win as much| Dallas 5, Texas. 

Sponsor of the contest is W. W-.|us $5000 in the Caruth Competiton. 
Caruth, Jr. prominent Dallas busi- All entries awarded first, second Y i 

. . . e “An Eliza nessman and philanthropist and anjor third prizes in any year will be Fraternit Holds oS alumnus of Southern Methodist Uni-| subject to option for copyright by y Pfhieer versity Southern Methodist University, and Of ficer 7 : 
the prize will be regarded as consid- Sororit eration for the option, with the op- a us mo er 

sic appropriate for use by students,| tion being effective until the entire 
faeulty and alumni of Southern Meth-| competition closes. 

ed somewha 

W orthington Assumes Duties 

As Campus ROTC Coramande; 
ina Drill Tez 

  
of the 

Cadet Captain Walter T. Worth- 

ington has assumed command of the | 

Drill] Team of Detachment 600 of the | 

4ir Foree ROTC here on campus. | 

\long with other recently elected of-| 

ivers, he will head the precisian out- | tents 

“it during the fall quarter. | 

Cadet Capt. Worthington is a sen-/} 

tor and is majoring in industrial arts. | perg 

Other Drill Team Officers are Ca- I-day 

det S. Sgt. Clois W. Anders, second 

the entries 

Thur., Oct. 13: College Union Student 

Board Meeting, 3rd floor social 

room, Wright Bldg., 6:30 p.m. 

DEPARTMENTAL MEETINGS 

Fri., Oct. 14: Movie: “Five Gates to 

Hell,” Delores Mitchell, Austir 

1959. 

Deadline Announced 
Original songs with words and mu- 

were collected   
Beginners’ Bridge 

Union TV Room, 

tions or com 

pers col 

f each contest   
  

  

  
men at WHAT TO DO TILL THE 

PSYCHIATRIST COMES 
Once upon a time at the University of Virginia there wa 
coed named, oddly enough, Virginia University who was hanc- 
some and kindly and intelligent and ingeniously constructed 
and majoring in psychology. Virginia went steady with a young 
man on campus named, oddly enough, Oddly Enough who was 
supple and fair and lithe and animated and majoring in phys ed. 

Virginia and Oddly enjoyed a romance that wa idyllic as 
y, as placid as a millpond. Never did the fight 

never, never, never!—because Virginia, who was majoring in 
psychology, did not believe in fighting. “Fighting,” she often . 

: said, “settles nothing. The scientific way is to look calmly for 
the cause of the friction.” 

ances. 
Intere 

notice 

In the elections for floor represen- 32 Ras 
tatives Johnny Parker was elected for Illinois. 
‘he first floor, Danny Ray for sec- Sieh 
ond floor, and Frank Delton for third 4 
floor. 

Roy Hall won by unanimous deci- 
sion for fourth floor in a run-off 
clection against Richard Blackwelder. 

The recently elected officers for 
East Garrett Dormitory are: Presi- 
dent, Sandra Yorks; Vice President, 
Adrian Waters; Secretary, Becky 
Coley; Treasurer, Peggy Chambers. 

Sandra is a senior from Durham 
ead is majoring in library science. 
Adrian is a senior from New Bern 
and is majoring in primary educa- 
ion. Becky is a senior from Rocky 
Mount and is majoring in business. 
Peggy is a senior from High Point 
and is majoring in grammar educa- 
tion, 

The new hal! Proctors are Faye} jice Departn: Benton, Ann Craft, Lillian Currie,] ; rel. 

a summer d 

  

age issue of Playboy 

er cent of all. 

ing the hig I was really lost 
without my new 

Esterbrook “101” pen! 

ship of any m 

Harrell Releases 
Accident Revort 

This is the 
jorts to com 

So whenever she and Oddly were on the verge of a quarrel, 
she used to whip out a series of ink blot tests and they would 
discover the true underlying cause of their dispute and deal 
with it in an enlightened, dispassionate manner. Then, the 
uritant removed, their romance would resume its tranquil, 
serene, unruffled course,   

accident 
damage done 

At present the 
istered on 
of September the 
dents. The amou 
estimated at $500 

Chief Harre!! h 
dents “will benefit 

be 4 
~ 

/S 
ae set c 3! = 

ae 
‘ Tey af ee 7 77 \oull be bald beforé Nau 7719: 

After six months of this sedate liaison, Oddly was so bored | he could spit. He loved Virginia well enough, but he also be- lieved that people in love ought to fight now and then. “It opens the pores,” he said. “And besides, it’s so much fun mak- ing up afterwards.” 
But Virginia would not be provoked into a quarrel. One night Oddly tried very hard. “Hey,” he said to her, “your nose looks like a banana, and your ears look like radar antenna, and your face looks like a pan of worms,” 
“My goodness, we're hostile tonight!” said Virginia cheerfully and whipped 120 Rorschach cards out of her reticule. “Come,” she said, “let us examine your psychic apparatus.” Oddly tried again. “You're fat and dumb and disagreeable,” he said, “and you'll be bald before you're thirty.” “Hmm,” said Virginia thoughtfully and kt a cigarette. “This sounds like an anxiety neurosis with totemism, anagogic trauma, and a belt in the back.” 
“Thate you,” said Odadly. “T hate your looks and your clothes and your toenails and your relatives and the cigarettes you smoke.” 
“Now, hold on, buster!” cried Virginia, her eyes crackling, her color mounting, her nostrils aflame. “Just keep a civil tongue in your stupid head when you talk about Marlboro! Nobody's knocking that filter, that flavor, that pack or flip-top box while there’s breath in my body! It’s a full-flavored smoke, it’s a doozy, it’s a dilly, it’s a gas—and anybody who says a word against it gets this.” 

* By “this” Virginia meant a series of combinations to the head and liver, which she now delivered to Oddly and turned on her heel and stormed away. 
Oddly brought her down with a flying tackle. “I love you with all my heart,” he said. 
“And Marlboro?” said she. 
“And ‘Marlboro even more,” said he. 
And they kissed and plaited love knots in one another’s hair and were married at Whitsuntide and smoked happily ever after. 

© 1000 Maz Shutmen 

| were: Georgia Hooks, President; Ann sta er Marshburn, Vice President; Martha 
Hudgins, Secretary; and Dottie Glov- er, Treasurer. 

: In order to be elected, these girls no bigger 
than a pack 

reports and 

more carefull) must be of good character and to re- | main in office, they must maintain | at least a 3 average. 

tion of € 
‘Lhe narrow stre 
which are on ou 
intended to be Club Elects Keziah vay. This and Michael W. Keziah of Gastonia, | pus is newly elected president of the Men’s| *aint a fairly clea Glee Club, will head activities of the | Speeding is discour 40-member music organization during aes 

N ti 

che 1960-61 term. 

Several foreign 

A graduate of Hamlet High School, ke is a freshman music Major and a member of the Men’s Judiciary. 
Chosen to serve with Keziah as| dents have organized “Les Amis officers of the Men’s Glee Club are| Francais”. They are Jerry H. Prescott, vice president; | Students who would like to enhance 

Mike W. Kilpatrick, secretary; and| their speaking ability in French Bennet H. Tolliver, business manager.| Meet with them each Thursday at 
5:00 p.m. in front of the library 
Members of the group are Cathe- 

rine Labaurne, Maggy Tamura, 

Plans for this year’s 

Pierre Benmouyal, Wes Howard and Judy Powell 

  
overloaded 

Ski-time or study-time, there’s no friend like the 
Esterbrook “161” fountain pen. Rescues you from any 
number of difficult situations. It’s a different type of 
cartridge pen. It carries 2 cartridges of liquid ink . . . one 
is a spare ...8o there’s no need to run out of ink—at 
any altitude! 

New, but still gives you 32 pen points to choose from, 
So you're bound to find one that’s right for your person- 
ality. Or, think of the fun you'll have switching— 
Points or personalities—until you find the one you like best, 

Schuss down to your dealer's and pick up the 
Esterbrook “101” Renew Pzint Fountain Pen, today. The 
Cost: just $1.95. 5 colors. Available in squeeze-fill, too! 

language stu 

inviting all   78 
Including 1000 Staples 

A do-it-yourself kit in the Palm of your hand! Unconditionally guar. anteed, Tot makes book cover: — Papers, does arts and Crafts work, mends, tacks... } of uses! 
setter Buy it at your college book Store) 

: ‘ar before several 
in Greenville and will   

SATURDAY-SUNDAY-MONDAY 
Oct. 15-16-17 

The Sins, Hates and Loves Of 4 

Southern Town Laid Bare! 

“DESIRE IN 
DUST” 

staring 

Raymond Burr 
Martha Hyer 

TUEESDAY-WEDNESDAY 
AVA GARDNEER in 

“Angel Wore Red” 

PITT Theatre 

  
THERE: 

e e e 

You too can smoke happily—with Marlboro, or with Marlboro’s unfiltered companion cigarette, Philip Morris— available in regular size or the sensational new king sise Commander. Havea Commander—weicome aboard! —— nt  
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vere may well deter- 
you are. Your education, 
financial history, work 

and leisure-time activity 
ermne how successful you 

ek less world, according 
dy recently completed 
hamber Executives, 
alf long study, one 

iprehensive research 
arried out on a group 

vus initiated by ACCK’s 
Standards Committee 
by Byron Harless & 
anagement consult- 

Tampa, Florida. 
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5 executive 

y factors 

success 
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Fraternity Installs 
New Pledge Class 
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scholar- 
individuals. Presi- 
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eadership. and 

Weis stated 
he largest ever to 

hapter and that the 
well pleased with the 

ha’s new pledges are 
Melvin Ellis, Tim 

Johnson, Tommy Ellen, 
Ralph Williams. 

stalled were Bob Baird, 
Dan Williams, Richard 

ran, Sandy Dal- 
nis. Also, Bob Fitz- 

Foster, Buddy 
e Hathaway, Robert 

e, Buddy Murray, 
Billy Worrell, and Mike 

e new Pika pledge 

Red” 

Society Announces 
Spportunities For 
Poetry Writers 

an College Poetry So- 
hat its fourth semes- 

itstanding collesve 

mpiled for pub- 
Interested 

opportunity 

year 

lished 

be the orici 

lent (who shal! 
the material), 

Executive Seere- 

care of the Society, 
t’s name, address, and 

x 

page 
may deal with any 

48 lines, nor 

submit more than 

ot exceed 

1a 
Entries which are not ac- 

publication will be return- 
npanied by a stamped, self- 
envelope, but they cannot 

acknowledged, nor can 
compensate students for 

which is published. 
entries must be postmarked not 

midnight, December 9, 
considered, and the de- 

s of the Society judges are final. 

be 

SMITH’S MOTEL 
45 Air Conditioned Rooms 

Room Phones - T. V. 

SWIMMING POOL 

Phone PLaza 8-1126 

Parents and Guest of College 

Students Welcome 

and | 

  

se who had not been So Successful in this field, 
Advantages of New Procedure * For the Chamber of Commerce ield, the implications of this new Procedure for evaluating executive success are tremendous. First, it will be possible, for the first time, to be able to predict with considerable ac- curacy whether a young man has the potential to become an outstandingly Successful Chamber executive. Sec- ond, the form will be valuable in rating the management potential of present staff men in the Chamber field. Also the Precedure utilized in developing this evaluation procedure Chamber top executives ean be ‘pplied to other fields as well. 

While there have been other studies carried out with groups of e 
in the past, only 
were studied, 

for 

xecutives 
successful groups 

This present study ap 
pears to be not only the most compre- 
hensive in of the number of 
‘xecutives studied, but by having 
both an outstanding as well as a less 
successful group, it repre 
break 

terms 

sents a new 
gh in the difficult prob 

Cash ‘Scholarships | 
Offered By ‘House 
Of Edgeworth’ 

Two $500 cash scholarships are 
‘ow available for graduate and under- 
graduate 
romies, 

  

students of business, eco- 
marketing, advertising and 

commerce in the first annual “House 
of Edgeworth Scholarship Conte 
One $500 scholarship will go 

the undergraduate student who 
mits the best advertising slogan with 
supporting brief of not more than 
500 words for House of Edgeworth 
smoking tobaceo. Winner of th 
nd $500 award will be the graduate 
student who writes the best market- 
ng plan for selling tobaccos to the 

college market. 

Announcing plans for the contest, 
J. Carroll Taylor, Vice-President of 
Larus & Brother Company, Inc., said, | 
“We would to adver- 
tising and marketing scholarship in 
our nation’s colleges and universities, 
and hope this contest will help 
by aiding worthy in their} 
education and by offering another | 
opportunity to supply classroom stud- 

s to practical business problems. 
In addition the cash awards, 

nation-wide publicity about the win- 
ners in journals of advertising and} 
marketing will prove valuable in 
tarting the winning students on sue- 

cessful business careers, Mr. Taylor 
added. 

Entries, to be judged on the basis 
of originality, expression, and prac- | 
tical merchandising value, must be | 
postmarked no later than midnight, 
March 15, 1961, Further contest in-! 
formation can be obtained from La- 
rus & Brother Company, Inc., Rich- 

sub- 

le sec 

like encouage 

we 

students 

ie 

to   mond, Virgin | 

lem of selecting executives, 
The Typical Executive 

The typical suecessful Chamber ex- 
ecutive has shown a significant pat- 
cern of leadership in high schoo] and 
college, Almost all had engaged ex- 
‘ensively in a large number of extra- 
curricular activities. Also, he almost 
nvariably was a leader in terms of 
holding office. The typical successful 
executive had frequently come from 
a stable, middle class family. The ma- 

jority had eithér had to work while 
growing up to help provide for their 
education, or even where it was not 
absolutely necessary, most had work- 
ed at least part of their way through 
college. 

Furthermore, the typical successful 
Chamber executive often works be- 
nind the scenes, and lets the coim- 
munity business executive take the 
iimelight. 

  

‘Reporter Suggests That Art 
Critics Learn Their Subject - 

By JIM STINGLEY, JR. 
That’s a pretty strange object 

placed in front of Rawl Building, isn’t 
it, One might wonder about its sig- 
nificance. We aan see that it portrays 
2 nude woman, but why, What is the 
reason for erecting it in front of the 
public’s eye, 

In the past, Art has been sadly. 
tuistreated he.e because no one has 
any knowledge as to the reason for 
these displays. They make fun of the 
\rt Department, they critize the peo- 
ole in it and the work that they do. 

It is common knowledge that one 
must know something about the oh- 
ject n, before he can right- 
fully e. When one de-rates 
something he knows nothing of, he is 
showing his own ignorance. We have 
been doing this! 

The statue in front of Rawl build- 
ing is just one of many that will ap- 
pear there and around campus. The 
reason? To the campus 
to the reasons for art, and to make 
clear the significance of creative art. 
Too many students have no idea why 
some of the objects are placed on dis- 
play. The Art Department would 
ike to try and show them the rea- 

sons. 

or pers: 
critic 

educate as 

These people in our college who 
their time to art, are proud 

of what they ure doing. It is their 
life, and they put in it what they feel. 
it might interest you to know that 

yu see some of the more pro- 

cevote 

Free Movie Offers 
Unusual Characters 

to Hell” is the free 

Audi- 

“Five Gates 

movie be Austin 

stober 14, 

to sbewn at 

turium, Friday 

Generally, there are interesting 
characterization: well-played by all 
involved. 

Neville Brand, as a semi-barbaric 
chieftan, comes to love Delores Mich- 
1els, who is one of the pretty nurses 
deposited in a jungle fortress by lust- 
ful, blood thirsty, Communists. 

Also starring are: Patricia Owens, 
a hard bitter fatalist; Ken Scott, a 
stalwart physician; and Linda Wong. 

“Mr. Clavell, writer-director-pro- 
lucer of this movie has carved a grip- 
ping little chiller out of a jungle”, 
ays Bobby Crowther, a New York 

Times critic. Melodramatic content is 
evident throughout the entire story. 

  

Watch For Cerise and Blue Bow 

  

FRI. OCT. 21, et 6:30 PM at WILLIAM NEAL REYNOLDS COLISEUM, 
N.C, STATE COLLEGE 

Tichata: $2.00, $2.50, $3.00, $3.50 
(NOW ON SALE—Raleigh: Coliseum Box Office, William Neal Reynolds, N.C. State College, TE 2-0523; Womble’s inc., 111 West Hargell St. Bewntewn Raleigh: 
Kerr Rexel Drugs, Cameron Village, Raleigh; Chapel Hill: Sloan Drug Co., 101 
£. Franklin St., $455; Burham: Walgreen Drug Store, 102 W.. Main St., 58241. 
MAIL ORDER: Make checks payable to “Coliseum Box Office” William Neal 
Reynolds, N.C. State College, Raleigh. Enclose 

eropuction vetope. A LIMELIGHT-CAWCON 
stamped Selt-eddressed on 

  

gressive paintings and statues, you 
2re looking at a person’s feelings. 

‘Every bit of paint, or piece of clay 
has a definite meaning. This meaning 
nas come from within the artist. He 
1s very sincere about what he is doing 
and very proud of his finished 
sroduet. We who know nothing about 
this, should stop and think before 

criticize. 

is 

ve 

Sorority Completes 
Fall Informal Rush 

Chi Omega Scrority revently com- 
rleted an informal rush, pledging 
seven girls. The girls are: Nancy 
Coggins, Judy Smith, Celia May, Sa'- 
‘ie Mewborn, Sarah Lou White, Peg- 
ey Daniels, and Dawn Reeves. 

Rush parties were held on Septem- 
ber 27, at the college picnic grounds, 
where a weiner roast was enjoyed; 
eon September 29, at the Alumni 
Building, where a dessert party was 
held; and on October 3, when Mrs. 
Leo Jenkins entertained at a coffee 
hour at the first lady’s home on Fifth 
Street. Chi Omega’s special initiates 

the sorority’s advisors, Pic- 
tures were taken by Jim Kirkland. 

On October 5, the new pledges and 
sisters ate dinner at the Silo Restau- 
rant. On Thursday the seven girls 
were pledged officially. 

Alpha Delta Pi Pledges 
Seven At Rush Party 

Alpha Delta Pi Sorority recent], 
held an informal rush Party at the 
home of Jeanne Moye of Brookgreen. 

The sorority pledged seven g’ 
during a service on Tuesday night, 
October 4 at the Alumni Building. Af- 
ter the pledge service, the members 
of the sorority gave the new initiates 
a coke party. Betty Lane Evans, song 
mistress, ended the affair by leading 
the group in one of their favorite 
songs. 

The new pledge group includes 
Jenny Lynn Walston, Dianne McCul- 
ley, Judi Cullifer, Betty Sue Carson, 
Tennys Bowers, Kathy Salle, and 
Ginny Fowle. 

By MARCS5LLE VOGEL 
Eleven years ago, Ruth Bostian, a 

student in physical education at East 
Carolina College, went on a swim- 
ming outing, dived into a shollow 
swimming poo! and broke her neck. 

Just recently at McGuire Veteran: 
Administration Hospital where she’s 
a patient, Miss Bostian picked up 4 
cup of drinking water in one hand 
or the first time sinee the accident 
The reason for the change in phys 

cal ability and, she concedes, in men- 
tal attitude is a pair of braces that 
weigh eight ounces each. “TI call them 
my hands,” said Miss Bostian. 

The braces were “custom made” 
or Miss Bostian in the hospital’s 
orthopedic brace shop by Homer ©. 
ifughes. He’s been making bnaces 
since 1946, but he says, “this is one 
('m really proud of.” 

Hughes figures he spent 80 hours 
on Miss Bostian’s braces. They are 
made of aluminum. stainless steel, 

leather straps. The straps ar 
substituted for metal wherever po’ 
sible to cut down on possible loss of 
ireulation. 
The acting manager 

| ial wrote Hughes and said “. . . 
| Lave made it possible for her to ¢ 
Jry out many worthwhile activities 

| Her writing hes been speeded up to 
| the extent that it has enabled her 
| to complete her college correspond- 
jence course a great deal more rap- 
Jidly....” 

The corresponding course which 
she is taking from the University of 
Tennessee is Business Law, and her 
average so far is 97.6. Even before 

|she used the braces developed by 
| fughes, Miss Postian could laborious- 
ily hold a penci! with another brace. 
| The former Wave has only been 

| taking the correspondence course 4 
| r, but after she gets her bache- 

degree in Business Law she 
to study anatomy and _ physi- 

and   
| lor's 

; {TI | plar 
| clogy. 

What she ‘eels is a big step to- 
| ward study in that field came after 

Former Physical Education M 
With Disabilities By 

| 
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ajor Learns To Cope 
Conce “ing To Wear Braces 
  

RUTH BOSTIAN demonst: 
ia 

rates use of hand braces. 
  

she got her new braces. She’s begun 
working one dav a week at the Medi- 

al Virginia Hospita’, 
tints slides in 

Colleve of 

re she 
£y research division 

The cord injury to Miss Bos- 
tian back in 1949 cost her the use of 
irtually all hand and wrist muscles 

needed for grasping. But she still bas 
the use of flexor muscles in her wrist 
that enable her to use the braces. 

“Her hands ‘vere as limp as spag- 
hetti,” says Hughes. The chief of the 
orthopedic br. hop, A. L. Hogan 

spinal 

  

Music Student Receives Award 
From National Piano Guild 
Marie Sutton, junior music major, plished.” 

from Kinston, has been awarded a 
!3100 scholarship by the 
Guild of Piano Teachers. 

Dr. Irl Allison in a letter to Miss 
is “As President of the Suttoa said, 

is my great pleasure to inform you 
that your achievement in piano play- 
ing through ten years as a National 

jor International member of the Na- 
tional Fraternity of Student Musi- 
cians has resulted in your attaining 

| the Paderewski Memorial Medal, and 
\the Guild’s High School Diploma, the 
Sophomore Collegiate Diploma, and 

|has earned for you the highest un- 
dergraduate goal afforded by the 
“GPT, .a $100 scholarship for fur- 
ther study. Congratulations and best 
wishes to you, your teacher, and to 
your parents for the tenacity of pur- 
vose and the quality of work accom- 

  

National Guild cf Piano Teachers, it | 

National | jn Kinston for 

  

Miss Sutton studied piano while 
nine years and was a 

James Hardee. At East 
pupil of Miss E 

vabeth Drake. She member of 
Sigma Alpha Tota, national honor- 

professional women’s music fra- 

pupil of Mrs. 
Carolina, she is a 

is a 

A.C E. MEETS 
The Executive Board of the Asso- 

ciation for Childhood Education met 
n October 3, to discuss plans for 
is year. 
The business included making fi- 

nal plans for Homecoming. Also, the 
A. C. E. of selling chrysan- 
themums will be continued this year. 

The A. C. E. invites all Education 
and B. S. maj to join during the 
annual membership drive. 

project 

  

do girls get in your hair? 
This is the kind of problem ‘Vaseline’ Hair Tonic creates 
all the time. If you use water with your hair tonic (as 
most men do) count 
the oil that water removes. Use 
with ‘Vaseline’ Hair 

on ‘Vaseline’ Hair Tonic to replace 
all the water you want 

Tonic. Your hair looks great, stays 
neater longer. And just a little does a lot! 

MSamk > 2 
WS cman 7% VASELINE ain romic 

"18 A MEBIOTERED TRADEHARK OF CHESEBROUEN-PONO-S ING. 

~ Vaseline 

HAIR 

qq 
iy il 

the histol-| 

| dents can feel that they have a 

said, ‘We never had anyone who had 
so little to work with.” Hogan has 
“een working with such cases for 20 
vears.” 

Sorority Undertakes 
Service Project 

Recently Aloha Delta Pi Sorority 
undertook as a service project the 
cleaning up of a cant room in the 

Hall. This room 
will be a place where students can 
read over homework with the blind 
students on carr pus. 

The girls cleaned up the room and 
cnen painted the walls. They plan to 
put up some curtains and place otner 
dds and ends ahout so the blind stu- 

pleas- 
ant atmosphere in which to work. 

A sorority spokesman reports that 
the girls had a good time working 
on this project and hope the blind 
students will nrofit a lot from it, 

This is the B-52. Advanced as it 
may be, this airplane has one thing 
in common with the firet war- 
galleys of ancient Egypt...and 
with the air and space vehicles of 
the future. Someone must chart its 
course. Someone must navigate it. 

For certain young men this pre- 
sents a career of real executive 
opportunity. Here, perhaps you 
will have the chance to master a 
profession full of meaning, excite- 
ment and rewards...as a Naviga- 
tor in the U. S. Air Force. 

To qualify for Navigator train- 
ing as an Aviation Cadet you must 
be an American citizen between 19 
and 26/2—single, healthy and in- 
telligent. A high school diploma is 
required, but some college is highly 
desirable. Successful completion of 
the training program leads to a 
commission as a Second Lieuten- 
ant...and your Navigator wings. 

If you think you have what it 
takes to measure up to the Avia- 
tion Cadet Program for Naviga- 
tor training, see your local Air 
Force Recruiter. Or c'’- ind mail 
this coupon, 

There’s a place for tomorrow's 
leaders on the 
Aerospace Team. US. 

Force Air 
Tart, et coven 7a ey 

AVIATION CADET INFORMATION H 
Dept. SCLOI ~   Box 7608, Washington 4, D. C. 
| am between 19 and 26¥%, 2 citizen Siaee US: and a high schosl graduate 
Send_me detailed information, cceaee 
Aviation Cadet program.  
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Homecoming is just around the corner, and a dig crowd is expected 
to attend the Homecoming festivities which begin with a parade Saturday 
morning featuring the candidates for Homecoming Queen and the various 
float entries that will be vying for first place honors. The gala celebra- 

tion will come to an end Saturday mght (or we really should say early 
Sunday morning, for the coeds have actually been granted late permission 

30 a.m.) with the annual Homecoming Dance. 

Sandwiched in between all these events will be the feature attrac- 
tion of the afternoon, East Carolina versus Western Carolina in one of the 

rivalries on the North State Conference footcall slate. , 
The Pirates have not lost a homecoming contest in two years, down- 

ing Western in 1958 and Elon last season. The last team to whip EC in 
Southern Conference powerhouse, Davidson 

hottest 

its homeceming 

back in 1957 

Another interesting point about this game is that Western Carolina 
has yet to win a conference tilt, and the Catamounts were mated as one of 
the stronger teams in NS coaches pre-season polls. The visitors have been 

ack by Appalachian and Catawba in their only conference games this 

game was 

Still a third reason that this game should have a special bearing 
is the fiact that these two teams have locked horns on fourteen occasions 
and each has won seven times. Both Catamount Coach Dan Robinson and 
Pirate Coach Jack Boone would like nothing better than to get the edge 
on one another. It should develop into a real bang-up ball game for the 
simple reason that both clubs will be raring to go. The Catamounts be- 

e they want to sink their paws into a good substantial victory; the 
tes because they haven't quite had their fill of victories as they go 

after their fifth in a row. 

Pirates Are Impressive 

Although the Bues left some questions in mind after the Guilford 
game (the Pirates won 7-0), they were practically all erased in the next 
two local’s games. EC romped over Catawba 28-0 and came from behind 
to wipe out Elon 14-8, 

What most people don’t understand about this year’s football team 
is that although there were 11 lettermen returning, many of them had 
practically no experience against any rough competition They were still 
young when they traveled to Newport News for the first game of the sea- 

» and as Coach Boone predicted, they have made a lot of mistakes. But 
m this corner it appears that the team has come a long way and is 

improving with every game. 

Tough Schedule Ahead 

The Pirates have a difficult assignment for the remainder of the 
season meeting the powers of the Little Three Conference of South Caro- 
lina as well as the horses of the North State Conference. After the West- 

olina encounter, the Bues host Newberry, then travel to Appala- 
nd Lenoir Rhyne before returning to Greenville to do battle with 
resbyterian and the University of Richmond, a Southern Confer- 

ence entry. It should be added here that the Pirates will be needing the support and backing of the student body more so than ever in these up 
coming crucial battles. Who knows, maybe this will be the year that the conference crown will come to Greenville. 

PREDICTIONS FOR THE WEEK 

East Carolina over Western Carolina by 14. 
North Carolina over Wake Forest b 
Miami to topple South Carolina by 
Syracuse over Penn State by 7. 
Lenoir Rhyne over Guilford by 30. 
Appalachian over Catawha by 12. 
Georgia Tech over Auburn by 6. 
Duke over N. C. State by 7. 
Citadel over Richmond by 13. 
Tampa over Elon by 14, 
Wofford over Furman by 6. 
Clemson over Maryland by 13. 
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To err is human... 
to erase, divine with 

EATON’S CORRASABLE BOND 

Typewriter Paper 
Try it! Just the flick of a 

_ Pencil-eraser and your 
typing errors are gone! It’s 

like magic! The special 
surface of Corrasable Bond 
erases without a trace. Your 

first typing effort is the 
4 finished copy when 
orrasable puts things right. 
This fine quality band ae 

a handsome appearance to 
all your work. Saves time 

and money, too!   Erasable Corrisable is available in light, medium, heavy 
weights and onion skin.in Convenient 100-sheet packets 
and 600-sheet ream boxes. A Berkshire Typewriter 
Paper, backed by the famous Eaton name. 

EATON’S CORRASABLE BOND 
{+ Made only by Eaton 

EATON PAPER CORPORATION ® PITTSFIELD, MASSACHUSETTS 

TWO PIRATE STARTERS ... for S 
gert. Piland, a tackle, has been rated 
gert is a threat in the Buc backfield. 

AST CAROLINIAN 

oe genes | 

ter this 
lege Stadium. 

2-1 mark against rugged opposition 

belfback 

- 

aturday afternoon’s Homecoming tilt are Clayton Piland, left, and Nick 
by line coach Bill MeDonald as one of the best in the state. Fullback Hil- 

    

Rain, Mud 
To Halt Pi 

Elon 
st Downs 10 
Rushing 146 

s Passing 

Passes Att.-Compl. 
Passes Had Inte. 

Punting 

Fumbles Lost 

Penalties 0 

Showing a little of what 

5} 2. 
2 

3-30.7 

4 

champ- 
: ide of, East Carolina came 

from behind early in the fourth quar- 
fer to win over Elon 14-8. The score 
was indicative of the see-saw strug- 

ragea all night for both 
ball and field ition. 

The win placed East Carolina in 
a first place tie for North State Con- 
ference honors. with an impressive 
record of 3 wins and no losses. 

After taking the opening kickoff, 
on the first play from scrimmage 
Glenn Bass fumbled and Elon re- 
covered on the 35 yard line of EC. 
Then, the Pirates held the Christians 
ind took over the ball, only to have 
fullback Nick Helgert fumble, with 
Elon recovering on the yard line. 
The fighting Christians took advan- 
tage of this break and they scored 
on an end sweep by halfback Jim 
Short. Then, after a penalty moved 
the ball closer to the goal for the 

sle which 

  

And Christians Unable 
rate Drive To Victory 

By B. D. MILLS 
extra point play, Short made the same 
end sweep to score the two extra 
points, and Elon led ECC 8-0, to cli-| ne was finally knocked out of bounds 
max the scoring in the first quarter.| by the narrowest of margins. Several 

The Pirates gained ball possession} plays iater Strickland again sank his 
in the second quarter, and marched] cleats into the scoring soil for the 
to Elon’s ona yard line, where sopho-| final tally of the evening. A Bert 

fullback Billy Strickland car-] Stafford to rman pass 
ried for the score. An attempted pass| was good or points, and 
play failed to gain any extra points,| the score stood at 14-8 for the re- 
ind at the end of the first half Elon| mainder of the game. 
led 8-6, 

Jand cut back to the left beautifully, 

and ran to the one yard line, where; 

| more Jones Loe 

two extra 

The game was played on a rain 
The second half got under way with | soaked, muddy field, which had been} 

the Christians driving up the middle, 
particularly with quarterback keeps | Fumbles played an important part in 
hy George Wooten. The Bue’s for-| the Elon’s 
vard wall held, and the Pirates took| and recovered fumbles by Chuek Gor- 
over late in the third quarter. Mac 

looked as if he had 
ot from the black mouth of 

a howitzer, was responsible mainly 
march that carried the Bucs 

to their own 43 yard line. On Thack- 
er’s key runs, Bob Gregson, the left 
guard, and Clayton Piland, left tack- 
le, opened a neat hole, through which 
Thacker scampered, ‘rol, along witk bad field positions In the early part of the final stan- were the main troubles with the Pi- za, fullback Billy Strickland took the| rate team. The Bues looked good at 
hall over the right side on a fullback have a long way to go,” 
series. He ran through a wide hole replied Head Mentor Jack Boone ‘ted by tackle, Henry Kwiatkow-| Billy Strickland looked impressive, and guard Wayne Davis. Strick-| and must receive some major credit 

ilayed on the two previous nights. 

kame, setting up score, 

Jon and Vernon Davis helped to stif- 
Thacker, who fle the Christian attack. 
been s. 

On defense, linebacker Gordon made 
tackles all over the field. The defen- 
sive secondary did a good job, too, 
‘ed by Sonny Baysinger, who made 
several last ditch tackles to prevent 
Elon from scoring. 

Offensively, the lack of ball con- 

for a 

times, bu 

  

COLLEGE SHOP’ 
PICK THE 
Circle Names Of Winnng Teams 

Mississippi State vs. 
Syracuse vs. 
Vanderbilt vs. 
Dartmouth vs. 
V. M. I. vs. 
Kentucky vs. 
Georgia Tech vs. 
N. C. State vs. 
Florida State vs. 
Tennessee vs. 
Wake Forest vs. 
West Virginia vs. 

*Total points of ECC-Western Carolina game 
*Used as a tie-breaker. 

Winner Receives $10.00 Gift Certificate at 

THE COLL 
Name __ 

Address 

Signature 

for the win, 
Bert Stafford ealled his best game, 

due partly to his increasing famil- arity with the system, and his own! 
offense was really a team effort and | on several plays the linemen really “scoffed-up” the Christians, 
the Pirate backs to scoot. 

  
WINNERS 
  

Georgia 
Penn State 

Florida 
Holy Cross 

Virginia 
L. S. U. Who are the opposition that the Auburn East Carolina crid team have to en- counter with curing the remai, 5 inde of the 1960 season? — This can be answered in one small vhrase, “Tough opponents.” This week’s homecoming game sees a mighty fine Western Carolina eleven knock heads with the Bues. The Catamoun 

Dart of the state have a Tough group that are eaual to last year’s team who boasted resin: respectable 7-2-1 

North Carolina 
Pittsburg 

EGE SHOP   
Contest open to college students only. 
Copies must’ be turned in at The College Shop by noon (12:00) Saturday. 

Score of ECC game will he used in case of tie. 
Person picking most winners will be awarded Gift Certificate, Winner will be announced on 

even, and the 1959 
champions, Lenoir 

. Both being away mean a defeat to Glenn 
pany. But this is neg Monday at The College Ghep. East 

‘ast Caroling 

pressive age! 
end a rough 

helping | added 

of Presbyterian 
South Carolina school will bring a strong eleven to Greenville, that is a 

i ’ 
accustomed to playing Southern Con- 

By RICHARD BOYD 

7 ijna will offer an ag- 

jal Seas pt of fast backs, 

line when the Cata- 
he le and gold take ont 

nts of purp‘e # i ‘ 

Brice in the homecoming a. 

sar thi Saturday at 2:00 p.m. in Col- 

The men of Coach Dan Robinson 

vill offer not less than 21 —— 
v f 

-eturning from 
' mp 

Alek who racked up @ credible 7 

i * 
yas a 31- 

Included in the seven wins was 

1 i ver East Carolina. 

= Sete ater, a 6-0, 165 peed 

from Fairless Hills, Pennsy! 

vania will be the main Catamount | 

thre t. The Senior speedster set 3 

shoo] record by tallying 87 points 

t season. oo 

\ithough a 12-7 upset victim of 

‘atawba’s Indians last Saturday at 

‘alisbury, the Western Carolina el- 

en should be really “up” for their 

nated rivalries from across the state. 

This should be the toughest game 

‘or Coach Jack Boone’s Pirates thus 

far. When asking a few of the Pi- 

te performers what they thought of 

the Western Carolina team against 

he Bucs in the homecoming contest 

here were the replies: 

Sonny Basinger, senior, left-haif 

vack from Concord, North Carolina, 

“YT think 
of touch 

rough 

“Mac 

ster 

Turf Go Captein 

One Of EC’s Best 
By RICHARD BOYD 

A familiar sight on the grid iron 

for the past three years has been 

halfback Glenn Bass, the 6’ 1” 185 | 

ound Pirate sneedster. Bass has hit} 

his peak since becoming an East Car- | 
olina performer. | 

A native of Wilson, he was born} 

on April 12, 1939. His first deep in 
terest in football occurred early in| 

grammar school. Being small for his/ 
age at the time was a handicap to 
Glenn’s chances in the sport. 

By the time Glenn was in high 
schoo! he was a two sport performer 

football as well as baseball, but| 
his size still held him back. Limited! 
to defensive action until his senior 

Wilson High School, Bass year at 

; began to make a name for himself 
S am outMtanding offensive hack | 

Le 

latter portion of his final scho-| * 
tic days. 

It was not until his sophomore ~ 
year that Glenn began to make a 
freat name or himself in the North 
State league. But an early season | 
injury in the Presbyterian game/ 
foreed the Pirate speed merchant to 
the sidelines. | 

Last season was his best by far.|' 
Scoring 86 poirts, the Wilson senior 
ed the conference in rushing, as/ 
well as being named to the All Con- 
Terence, and second team all state 
‘eams. The latter includes the Big | 
Four. 

hat 

help t 

ast Oa 

MEN’S INTR4A 

br 

rE Football is not the only sport Bass |) 
1s making himself a name in. As a 

stop, the versatile athlete was 
tn All-Conference selection for Coach 
Jim Mailory’s nine last spring. 

Bass thinks highly of the Buc : 
| coaching staff saying that the coach to th 

Caro i : “ 

0 think ahead better. The jat East lino work as hard as al coaches in the country with the dif- ferent individuals on the team. He 
that 

spirit 

By RICHARD Boyp 

eague opponents. The Bucs hope to respond in good fashion from heir close 18-13 licking at the hands 
last season. The 

erence elevens. 
A game 

ppa 
Pi Kary 

Jones 
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To Campy 

Former EC Coach Hi 
Regrets For (hané 

Former Eas! 
coach Gary Ma 

he had not ¢ 
land to fi 
dock, who n 

rif
f 

ball coach at 
student score 
his team Saturdsy nig! 
ton. 

Strickland, who pares 
Cradock High School in  


